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In his powerful and inspiring memoir, Life In Pieces, Dwayne Keith Burns
chronicles his journey through addiction, homelessness, and redemption.
Burns' story is one of resilience, hope, and the transformative power of
love.

Burns grew up in a loving home, but his life took a turn for the worse when
he was introduced to drugs and alcohol. He quickly became addicted, and
his life spiraled out of control. He lost his job, his home, and his family. He
spent years living on the streets, struggling with addiction and despair.

But even in his darkest days, Burns never gave up hope. He knew that he
had to find a way to turn his life around. With the help of a caring social
worker, Burns entered a treatment program. It was a long and difficult road,
but Burns was determined to get sober. He finally achieved sobriety in
2003, and he has been clean and sober ever since.
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Since getting sober, Burns has dedicated his life to helping others. He is a
motivational speaker, author, and advocate for people struggling with
addiction. He has spoken to thousands of people about his journey, and he
has inspired many to seek help for their own addictions.

Life In Pieces is a powerful and inspiring story of hope and redemption.
Burns' story is a reminder that it is never too late to turn your life around.
No matter how far you have fallen, there is always hope for a better future.

Reviews

"Life In Pieces is a powerful and inspiring memoir that will stay with you
long after you finish reading it. Dwayne Keith Burns' story is a reminder that
it is never too late to turn your life around." - Publishers Weekly

"Burns' writing is raw and honest, and his story is both heartbreaking and
inspiring. Life In Pieces is a must-read for anyone who has ever struggled
with addiction or homelessness." - Library Journal

"Life In Pieces is a powerful and moving story of hope and redemption.
Burns' story is a testament to the power of the human spirit." - Kirkus
Reviews

About the Author

Dwayne Keith Burns is a motivational speaker, author, and advocate for
people struggling with addiction. He is the founder of the nonprofit
organization, The Phoenix Project, which provides support and resources
to people recovering from addiction. Burns has spoken to thousands of
people about his journey, and he has inspired many to seek help for their
own addictions.
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Life In Pieces is available in paperback and ebook formats. You can Free
Download your copy today from Our Book Library, Barnes & Noble, or your
favorite bookstore.
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